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Description
The Socket & See LOCKKIT220 stands as the pinnacle of
safety solutions for your electrical testing endeavours.
At its core lies the VIP200 Voltage Tester, meticulously
designed to meet the most stringent safety standards
including CAT IV 600V, BS EN61010, and HSE GS38. With
its precise AC and DC voltage measurement
capabilities spanning six calibrated steps, the VIP200
instills unwavering confidence in your testing
procedures.

Paired seamlessly with the sturdy SAFE CASE, the
Socket & See SP200 Professional Proving Unit ensures
not only the secure operation but also the protection
of your indispensable testing tools. This combination
guarantees peace of mind, knowing that your
equipment is shielded from potential damage in any
testing environment.

The LOCK PACK, featuring three customisable locking
devices complete with 3-digit combinations, serves as
an invaluable addition to the LOCKKIT220. This cost-
effective solution provides a reliable safeguard against
inadvertent energization of electrical installations,

reinforcing adherence to best safety practices in every
scenario.

Delving deeper into its functionality, the VIP200 offers a
comprehensive suite of features including continuity
testing, phase rotation analysis, and a single-pole test
function. Its Auto Test capability further ensures the
integrity of its batteries, facilitating consistent
performance throughout your testing endeavours.

Whether you're an electrician or engineer, the Socket
& See LOCKKIT220 empowers you to execute electrical
tests with unparalleled confidence and security. With
each component meticulously crafted to uphold the
highest safety standards, this kit serves as an
indispensable companion for professionals seeking
reliability and peace of mind in their testing processes.

Socket & See Safe Isolation & LOTO Kits
Socket & See ISOKIT 215
Socket & See ISOKIT 220

Socket & See LOCK PACK

Socket & See LOCKKIT215

■ Comprehensive kit for voltage testing and
lockout/tagout procedures

■ Includes VIP200 Voltage Tester and SP200 Proving
Unit

■ VIP200 is compact, measures AC/DC voltage in six
steps, features a silicone lead

■ SP200 is a portable voltage checker, ideal for
verifying two-pole testers

■ Lock-off devices feature customisable 3-digit
combinations for enhanced security

■ SAFE CASE ensures secure storage with pre-cut
holes for easy access to the proving unit

■ Compliant with safety standards BS EN61010 and
HSE GS38

■ Reliable and efficient for safe voltage testing and
lockout/tagout procedures in electrical work
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